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Introduction
Percutaneous gastrostomy feeding tube placement (PEG tube) is 

a fairly common procedure performed in hospitals by Interventional 
Radiologists, Surgeons and Gastroenterologists. Complications such 
as bleeding, infection albeit rare are some of the potential immediate 
complications of a PEG tube placement. A more feared complication 
of a placement of a PEG tube is placement through another organ such 
as the colon or liver. We describe a case whereby Endoscopic Ultra-
sound (EUS) was used to manage such a complication.

Case

A 78 year-old female with no significant past medical history 
was admitted to an outside hospital for management of chronic dys-

phagia, weight loss, and failure to thrive. Although vital signs were 
normal, physical examination was notable for a thin elderly cachectic 
appearing female. To address her dysphagia and failure to thrive, she 
underwent percutaneous endoscopic gastrostomy (PEG) placement. 
Although mild pain and tenderness may be expected one day after 
PEG placement, the patient reported abnormally significant pain re-
quiring further evaluation. Therefore, a computed tomography scan 
was performed reporting transection of the PEG through the left lobe 
of the liver (Figure 1a). It was decided after discussion to transfer the 
patient to a tertiary care center. Once the patient was transferred, 
she was deemed to be high risk for any surgical intervention given 
her cachectic and malnourished state. Interventional Endoscopy was 
consulted for consideration of endoscopic removal. After discussing 
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risks/benefits with family of endoscopic removal as well as consid-
ering risks of surgical removal, it was decided to proceed with en-
doscopic removal. After sedation and intubation, a linear echoendo-
scope was passed to her stomach to visualize the liver. Endoscopic 
ultrasound confirmed liver transection; however, no major hepatic 
blood vessels were traversed (Figure 1b). Doppler flow was used to 
confirm lack of vascular penetration. Since the risk of hematoma de-
velopment after PEG tube removal was likely low, it was deemed ap-
propriate to proceed with PEG tube removal. 

After removal of the echoendoscope, the external portion of the 
PEG tube was cut (Figure 1c). An upper endoscope was then passed 

and the internal bumper and the remainder of the shaft of the PEG 
tube was removed with the help of a snare. Next, the resulting fistu-
lous tract was closed with an over-the-scope clip (Ovesco, 11/6, Ger-
many) (OTSC) (Figures 1d & 1e). The linear echoendoscope was then 
re-introduced where the liver was reassessed. No obvious evidence 
of bleeding or hematoma was found on EUS. Finally, the scope was 
removed, and the external defect was left to heal by secondary inten-
tion. The next day, the patient reported resolution of abdominal pain 
and no leakage was found on inspection. Hemoglobin remained sta-
ble. Despite the successful outcome of the procedure, the patient was 
transitioned to comfort care for reasons unrelated to the EUS-guided 
PEG tube removal.

Figure 1.

Discussion
Percutaneous endoscopic gastrostomy (PEG) placement is a com-

mon procedure with multiple indications from chronic dysphagia 
to nutritional support. However, complications can occur including 
leakage, bleeding, fistula formation, and more [1]. Transection of the 
liver is a rare complication with one study documenting seven total 
cases reported in literature [2]. Although abdominal pain may be the 
most common symptom, other symptoms may include fever, nausea, 
transaminitis, PEG tube malfunction, or even no symptoms [2-7]. 
Prompt diagnosis by ultrasound or CT scan is imperative to confirm 
liver transection. Although laparotomy and conservative manage-
ment were the most common reported treatments, Endoscopic Ultra-

sound (EUS) guided evaluation may provide an effective alternative 
for management of PEG tube-related liver transections [2]. Since the 
implementation of EUS in gastroenterology, advanced endoscopists 
have discovered creative methods to improve patient outcomes while 
avoiding unnecessary surgeries. This case highlights an unfortunate 
rare complication from PEG tube placement. However, endoscopy 
could play a role in safely removing the PEG tube from the transected 
liver while closing the defect internally. In our case, EUS was initially 
used to evaluate if any hepatic blood vessel was traversed. If the EUS 
recognized a traversed blood vessel, the risk of hemorrhage or he-
matoma formation would be high if the PEG tube was to be removed 
endoscopically and alternative management would be warranted. 

https://dx.doi.org/10.26717/BJSTR.2024.55.008639


Copyright@ :  Veeral M Oza | Biomed J Sci & Tech Res |   BJSTR.MS.ID.008639.

Volume 55- Issue 1 DOI: 10.26717/BJSTR.2024.55.008639

46571

In such scenario, removal of PEG tube should be performed in In-
terventional radiology suite or the Operating Room with standby as-
sistance from interventional radiologist or surgeon respectively. For-
tunately, this patient had no traversed blood vessel; therefore, it was 
deemed appropriate to remove. Second, given that the PEG tube was 
traversing the liver, external removable would simply result in more 
trauma to the liver. Hence the tube was cut, and the internal bumper 
retrieved endoscopically, thereby achieving an atraumatic removal of 
the PEG. Once the PEG tube was removed, the gastro-hepato-cutane-
ous tract would need to be addressed. Over-the-scope clips (OTSC) are 
emerging endoscopic devices growing in popularity. They have been 
successfully used to close large ulcers, perforations, and fistulas [8]. 
To prevent the risk of leakage or fistula formation, an OTSC was suc-
cessfully deployed. Lastly, once the PEG tube is removed and the OTSC 
placed, EUS was performed to help confirm any intra-hepatic/ extra 
hepatic bleeding or expanding hematomas that may require further 
intervention. As EUS becomes more accessible, the field will require 
more creative approaches regarding its use. This case provides a cre-
ative way to implement EUS after a PEG complication. By anticipating 
potential complications with removing the PEG, EUS was used to lo-
cate potential blood vessels that may have been traversed. Therefore, 
EUS evaluation provided safe PEG removal knowing the bleeding risk 
was likely low. Endoscopic ultrasound has many therapies to offer; 
however, future documentation of unusual cases will help providers 
identify opportunities for its potential use.
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